



CITY OF
FAYETTEVILLE
ARKANSAS

Heavy Duty Trucks

Official Bid Tabulation
Lionel Jordan, Mayor

Date of Advertisement: 9/16/2019
Date of Issue: 9/16/2019

Bid No. 19-47
Date: 10/10/2019
Time: 2:00 PM

Item	Description	Each	Lewis Ford Sales Inc			Summit Truck Group			Superior Automotive		
			Chassis Cab	Body	Extended Price	Chassis Cab	Body	Extended Price	Chassis Cab	Body	Extended Price
1	1.5 Ton, Diesel, 4 x 4, Crew Cab, 9' Utility Body (Installed)	1	\$ 49,310.00	\$ 14,255.00	\$ 63,565.00	\$ 58,000.00	\$ 11,800.00	\$ 69,800.00	\$ 52,101.46	\$ 11,590.00	\$ 63,691.46
			FORD F550 4 x 4 Crew Cab			INTERNATIONAL / CV515			CHEVROLET SILV 5500 CC		
	Body Make/Model		KNAPEHEIDE 7108D			DAVIS/TRA 9 Inc.			KNAPEHEIDE CS DUMP		
2	1.5 Ton, Diesel, 4 x 4, Crew Cab, 9' Dump Body (Installed)	1	\$ 49,310.00	\$ 12,490.00	\$ 61,800.00	\$ 58,000.00	\$ 11,050.00	\$ 69,050.00	\$ 52,101.46	\$ 10,175.00	\$ 62,276.46
			FORD F-550 4 x 4 Crew Cab			INTERNATIONAL / CV515			CHEVROLET SILV 5500 CC		
	Body Make/Model		CRYSTELL E-TIPPER			KNAPEHEIDE / 7108D54			KNAPEHEIDE PCON 12-D		
3	1.5 Ton, Diesel, 4 x 2, Extended Cab, 11' Utility Body (Installed)	1	\$ 45,352.00	\$ 12,950.00	\$ 58,302.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 49,529.55	\$ 12,585.00	\$ 62,114.55
			FORD F-550 4 x 2 Ext Cab			No Bid			FORD F550 SUPERCAB		
	Body Make/Model		STAHL			No Bid			KNAPEHEIDE 7108054		
4	1 Ton, Gas, 4 x 4, Single Cab, 12' Flatbed Body (Installed)	1	\$ 30,712.00	\$ 12,650.00	\$ 43,362.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 31,683.60	\$ 11,150.00	\$ 42,833.60
			FORD F-350 4 x 4 Reg Cab			No Bid			CHEVROLET SILV 3500 REG CAB		
	Body Make/Model		CROWNLINE			No Bid			KNAPEHEIDE PHHT		
Total Base Bid			\$ 227,029.00			\$ 138,850.00			\$ 230,916.07		

Highlighted: Notes Calculation corrections

CERTIFIED:

[Signature]
A. Green, Purchasing Manager CPB, CPPD

[Signature]
Witness: Les McGaugh

10/2/19
Date

*NOTICE: Bid award is contingent upon vendor meeting minimum specifications and formal authorization by City officials.